Aggregate
Aggregate - Grade 3 - Cover Stone (1/2") (per ton)
At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up)

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX

Aggregate - Grade 4 - Cover Stone (3/8") (per ton)
At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up)

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX

9.10.18
Awarded in Commissioners Court 9.24.18

Brauntex
Materials

no bid
no bid

$20.00
$30.00

Caldwell County
Unit Road Bid Summary
Bid Opening - 9-10-18

. Colorado
Centex Materials .
Materials
$21.00 $25.00
no bid $31.89
no bid $25.00
no bid $31.89

Duran Gravel, Inc.

$20.00/yard
no bid

no bid
no bid



Asphalt Materials
SS1 Slow Set Emulsion (per gallon)
At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up)

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX

HFRS2 Rapid Set Emulsion (per gallon)
At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up)

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX

9.10.18

Awarded in Commissioners Court 9.24.18

Caldwell County
Unit Road Bid Summary
Bid Opening - 9-10-18

Ergon Asphalt &
Emulsions, Inc.

$2.27
$2.40

$2.27
$2.40

"Federal Environmental Fee will be added to above prices
at rate of $.49770/ton for asphalt & polymer loads or
$.00150/gal for emulsion loads."



Caldwell County
Unit Road Bid Summary
Bid Opening - 9-10-18

Petroleum Traders Triples/JOC Qil Schmidt & Sons, Sun Cost
Fuel & Diesel Company Inc. Resources, Inc.

Profit Margin for Supplier $0.0074 0.0795 $0.0125 $0.0990
Regular Unleaded (per gallon) $2.1304 $2.4975 $2.1491 $2.2321
various/ to Flint Hills Flint Hills Various

include/ Flint Hills Resources-E1087 Unbranded
Profit Margin for Supplier S0.0074 0.0795 $0.0125 $0.0790
No 2. Diesel (Low Sulfur)(per gallon) $2.3504 $2.8135 $2.3089 $2.3363

: incl

va:ﬁ:tsﬁri]ucslfes Flint Hills Flint Hills Various

Resources-TX LED Unbranded

Motiva

NOTE: During the term of this contract, fuel prices may increase or decreased based on the weekly average OPIS oruces from the Austin, TX rack. The amount designated as the supplier's profit
margin per gallon will remain constant for the term of the contract.

9.10.18

Awarded in Commissioners Court 9.24.18



Oil & Lubricants
Motor Oil SAE 15W-40 in Bulk (per gallon)

Hydraulic Fluid in Bulk (per gallon)

Chassis Grease
Per Cartridge
Per 5 gallon can

Anti-Freeze
Per 55 gallon drum
per 1 gallon

Multi-Purpose Automatic Tranmission Fuild in Bulk (per
gallon)

9.10.18
Awarded in Commissioners Court 9.24.18

American Lube
Supply

$6.11

Bel Ray Syn Blend
15/40 CK4

$6.38
Quantum
Hyperion J20C
Tractor Hyd

$2.62
$112.32

Hyperion Red
HDEP2

$406.45
$7.39

Prestone

Caldwell County
Unit Road Bid Summary
Bid Opening - 9-10-18

Allied
Sales/Golden
West/JOC Qil

Company
$7.41

Golden West
Heavy Duty CK-4
15w40

$6.78
Golden West
Premium Tractor
Hyd.

$2.054/tube
$69.51/pail

Golden West MP-
Red Grease

$329.00
no bid

All Temp Ext Life
Red Antifreeze
50/50

$10.98

Golden West
Tech/Syn Multi-
Vehicle ATF

Schmidt & Sons

$6.89

Warren
Lubriguard Syn
Blend

$5.85

Warren Premium
Tractor Fluid

$2.99
$122.94

Chevron Starplex
#H2

$340.00
$6.75

Marcus Products

Sun Coast
Resources, Inc.

$8.17

Total Rubia TIR
7900 15w40

$7.41

Total Dynatrans
MP

$2.35
$87.50

Total Multis
Complex EP2
$543.40

$9.47

Chev.Delo ELC
50/50

Safety-Kleen
Environmental
Sales

$6.75
Performance Plus
Heavy Duty Diesel

Synthetic Blend

Engine Oil 15w40

CK-4

$5.49
Performance Plus
Universal Tractor

Fluid

$3.20
$119.00

Performance Plus
Construction Red
Grease

$375.00
$6.82

Performance Plus
HD Extended Life
NAPS Free OAT



Flexible Base

9.10.18

Type A Black Base (per ton)
At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up)

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX

Type D Cold Mix (per ton)
At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up)

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX

3/4" Base (per ton)
At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up)

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX

1-1/2" Commercial Base (per ton)
At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up)

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX

Awarded in Commissioners Court 9.24.18

Caldwell County
Unit Road Bid Summary
Bid Opening - 9-10-18

Texas Materials  Centex Materials Duran Gravel, Inc. Brauntcex
Materials

no bid no bid no bid $50.00

no bid no bid no bid $60.00

no bid no bid no bid $50.00

no bid no bid no bid $60.00

no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid

$13.00 $7.50 $5.50/yard $5.75

$22.50 no bid no bid $15.75

Martin Marietta

$35.50
$63.18

$36.50
$64.18

$5.00
$12.98

$4.00

$11.98

1) price is for full

(22 tons Min)
trailer loads. 2)
Fluctuating Fuel

Surcharge per

Chart.)

Colorado
Materials

68 (cold mix)

75.55 (cold mix)

$68.00
§75.55

$4.00 (1/2")
$10.89

$4.00

$10.89



